
190 

Short title 
and citation. 

Commencement. 

False 
statements 
by dealers 
in proposals. 

Fraudulent 
sal or 
disposal of 
goods by 
hirer. 

Penalty. 

First 
Schedule. 

Third 
Schedule. 

Fourth 
Schedule. 

HIRE-PURCHASE ORDINANCE 1965 

No. 46 of 1965 

An Ordinance to amend the Hire-Purchase 
Ordinance 1961 

[Assented to 17th December, 1965.] 

BE it ordained by the Legislative Council for the Northern 
Territory of Australia, in pursuance of the powers con­

ferred by the Northern Territory (Administration) Act 1910-
1965, as follows:-

1.-( 1.) This Ordinance may be cited as the Hire-Purchase 
Ordinance 1965. 

(2.) The Hire-Purchase Ordinance 1961 is in this Ordin­
ance referred to as the Principal Ordinance. 

(3.) The Principal Ordinance; as amended by this Ordin­
ance, may be cited as the Hire-Purchase Ordinance 1961-1965. 

2. This Ordinance shall come into operation on the four­
teenth day of February, One thousand nine hundred and sixty­
six. 

3. Section 44 of the principal Ordinance is amended by 
omitting the words "Two hundred pounds" and inserting in their 
stead the words "Four hundred dollars". 

4. Section 46 of the Principal Ordinance is amended by 
omitting the words "Two hundred pounds" and inserting in their 
stead the words "Four hundred dollars". 

S. Section 51 of the Principal Ordinance is amended by 
omitting the words "Two hundred pounds" and inserting in their 
stead the words "Four hundred dollars". 

6. The First Schedule to the Principal Ordinance is amended 
by omitting the symbol "£" (wherever occurring) and inserting 
in its stead the symbol "$". 

7. The Third Schedule to the Principal Ordinance is amend­
ed by omitting the symbol "£" (wherever occurring) and in­
serting in its stead the symbol "$". 

8. The Fourth Schedule to the Principal Ordinance is 
amended by omitting the symbol "£" (wherever occurring) and 
inserting in its stead the symbol "$". 


