
TA BM ANIA. 

1916. 

ANNO SEPTIMO 

GEC)RGII 'T. REGIS~ 

No. 22. 

ANALYSIS. 

1. Amendment of Sectipns 42 and 43 of Principal Act. 
2. Previous poll to be sufficient. 
3. Interest to be charged. 

A.D. 
AN ACT to further amend "'fhe Lovett 1916. 

Lighting Act, J914," and for other pur
poses. [23 December, 1916.J 

WHEREAS it is desirable to further amend" The Lovett Lighting Preamble. 
Act, 1914," which Act is her~after referred to as "the Principal Act," 5 Geo. V. No. 6. 
by increasing the amount which may be granted by the Governor as a 
loan to the Warden, councillors. and electors of the Municipality of Port 
Cygnet, for the purposes of the Principal Act, to the sum of Four 
thousand seven hundred Pounds. 

4d.] 

.. 1 



136 

A.D.1!:I16. 

Amendmellt of 
Sections 42 and 
43 of Principal 
Act. 

Previous poll to 
be sufficient. 

J n terest to be 
charged. 

4 Ed. VII. No. 
23. 
6 Geo. V. No. 
64. 

7) GEORGII V. No 22 

L(lvett Lighting. 

Be it therefore enacted bv His Excellenc the Governor of Tasmania, 
by and with the advice an'd consent of t' e Legislative Council and 
House of Assembly in Parliament assemble , as follows:-

1 The Principal Act. as amended by Section One of 6 George V. 
No. 2.3, is hereby further amended as follows: - . 

I. Section Forty-two ef the Principal Act is herf'by amended. 
by striking- out the words" Two thousand seven hundred" . 
(which, by Section One of 6 George V. ~ o. 25, were sub
stituted for the words" Two thousand "), and by inserting 
ill lieu thereof the words" Four thousand seven hundred." 

n. Section 4:1 of the Principal Act is hereby amended by 
striking out the words "Two thousand seven hundred" 
(which, by Section One of 6 George V. No. 25, were 
substituted for the words" Two thousand"), and by insert
ing in lieu thereof the words "Four thousand seven 
hundred." 

2 The Poll taken on the Twentieth day of November, One thou~and 
nine hundred and thirteen, is hereby declared to be sufficient for the 
purposes of the Principal Act ami Amending Act as amended by this 
Act. . 

3 The rate of interest to be paid in respect of this further loan of 
Two thousand Pounds authorised by this Act shall be fixed and deter
mined by the Governor pursuant to the provisions of -, The Local Public 
Works Loans Amendment Act, ]!)04," and any amendments thereof. 
provided that for the purposes of the said further loan the maximum 
rate therein mentioned mav be exceeded, and the worus "Two 
POllnris" shall be deemed" to be substituted for the words "One 
Pound " IlIf'ntio!!ed in Paragraph 11. of Sectioll Two of the last
mentioned Act as amended. 

JOHN VAIL. 
GOVERNMENT PRINTER. TAS_NU. 


