
1982 Local Government Amendment (Contracts) No. 35 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT AMENDMENT (CONTRACTS) 
ACT 1982 

No. 35 of 1982 

TABLE OF PROVISIONS 

1. Short title. 
2. Principal Act. 
3. Amendment of section 138 of Principal Act (Simplified 

procedure for municipal contracts). 
4. Amendment of section 139 of Principal Act (When 

tenders must be called). 

AN ACT to amend the Local Government Act 1962 for the purpose 
of making further provision with respect to contracts to which 
municipalities are parties. 

[Royal Assent 14 October 1982] 

BE it enacted by His Excellency the Governor of Tasmania, by and 
with the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and 

House of Assembly, in Parliament assembled, as follows:-

1-This Act may be cited as the Local Government Amendment Short title. 

(Contracts) Act 1982. 

647 



648 

Principal Act. 

Amendment of 
section 138 of 
Principal Act 
(Simplified 
procedure for 
municipal 
contracts) . 

Amendment of 
section 139 of 
Principal Act 
(When tenders 
must be 
called). 

No. 35 Local Government Amendment (Contracts) 1982 

2-In this Act, the Local Government Act 1962* is referred to 
as the Principal Act. 

3-Section 138 (3) of the Principal Act is amended by omitting 
" $500 " and substituting " $2 500 ". 

4-Section 139 (1) of the Principal Act is amended by omitting 
" $1 000 " and substituting" $10 000 ". 

* Nfl. 67 of 1%2 For this Act, as amended up to and including 1st July 1980, see the continuing Reprint of 
Statutes Subseq;Jently amended by Nos. 19, 44, and 59 of 1980 and by Nos. 48, 77, and 89 of 1981. 


