
1987 Penalty Units and Other Penalties No. 13 

PENALTY UNITS AND OTHER PENALTIES ACT 1987 

No. 13 of 1987 

TABLE OF PROVISIONS 

1. Short title. 

2. Commencement. 

3. Interpretation. 

4. " Penalty units ". 

5. Amendment of certain Acts, 
in relation to penalty units and 
other penalties. 

6. Consequential amendments of 
Acts Interpretation Act 1931 
and Act s Interpretation 
Amendment Act 1981. 

7. Amendments consequential on 
commencement of P 0 1 ice 
Offences Amendment Act 
(No. 2) 1985. 

8. Application of Act. 

9. Transitional provision. 

SCHEDULE 1 

AMENDMENTS OF CERTAIN ACTS 

IN RELATION TO PENALTY 

UNITS AND OTHER PENALTIES 

SCHEDULE 2 

CONSEQUENTIAL AMENDMENTS OF 

ACTS INTERPRETATION ACT 1931 
AND ACTS INTERPRETATION 

AMENDMENT ACT 1981 

SCHEDULE 3 
AMENDMENTS CONSEQUENTIAL ON 

COMMENCEMENT OF POLICE 

OFFENCES AMENDMENT ACT 

(No. 2) 1985 

SCHEDULE 4 
AMENDMENTS CONSEQUENTIAL ON 

COMMENCEMENT OF POLICE 

OFFENCES AMENDMENT ACT 

(No. 2) 1985 

111 





1987 Penalty Units and Other Penalties No. 13 

PENALTY UNITS AND OTHER PENALTIES ACT 1987 

No. 13 of 1987 

AN ACT to provide generally for the introduction of a penalty 
units system with respect to offences against Acts and subordinate 
instruments in place of the existing system providing for 
penalties in monetary terms, to amend certain Acts for the 
purpose of introducing that system, to increase certain penalties 
for offences against the Police Offences Act 1935, the Alcohol 
and Drug Dependency Act 1968, and the Road Safety (Alcohol 
and Drugs) Act 1970, and to amend the Acts Interpretation Act 
1931 and the Acts Interpretation Amendment Act 1981. 

[Royal Assent 29 April 1987] 

BE it enacted by His Excellency the Governor of Tasmania, by and 
with the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and 

House of Assembly, in Parliament assembled, as follows:-

113 

1-This Act may be cited as the Penalty Units and Other Penalties Sborttltle. 

Act 1987. 

2-( 1) Except as provided in this section and subject to sub- CommcDce

section (3), this Act shall commence on the day on which it receives ment. 

the Royal as~ent. 



114 No. 13 Penalty Units and Other Penalties 1987 

( 2) Section 6 and Schedule 2 shall be deemed to have commenced 
on 30th September 1981. 

( 3) Where the day on which this Act receives the Royal assent 
is a day before the day fixed by proclamation under section 2 (2) 
of the Police Offences Amendment Act (No. 2) 1985-

( a) section 7 (1) and Schedule 3 shall commence on that 
first-mentioned day; and 

( b) section 7 (2) ~md Schedule 4 shall commence on the day 
so fixed by proclamation. 

(4) \Vhere the day on which this Act receives the Royal assent 
is a day on or after the day fixed by proclamation under section 2 (2) 
of the Police Offences Ame:tdment Act (No. 2) 1985-

(a) section 7 (2) and Schedule 4 shall commence; and 
(b) section 7 (1) and Schedule 3 shall be repealed, 

on the day so fixed by proclamation. 

~~~':~ 3-In this Act-

"Penalty 
units n. 

" statutory rule" has the meaning assigned to that expression 
by the Rules Publication Act 1953; 

" subordinate instrument" means an instrument that is
(a) a statutory rule; or 
(b) not a statutory rule but which is a regulation, 

rule, or by-law or any other instrument of a 
legislative character. 

4-Where, in any Act or subordinate instrument for the time 
being in force, a number (whether whole or fractional) of what 
in the Act or subordinate instrument are referred to as "penalty 
units " is prescribed as the penalty for an offence against that Act 
or subordinate instrument, then the Act or subordinate instrument 
shall, subject to section 37 of the Acts Interpretation Act 1931, be 
construed as setting out a penalty of & number of dollars equal to 
the product obtained by multiplying $100 by the number of penalty 
units so prescribed. 



1987 Penalty Units and Other Penalties No. 13 115 

5-The Acts specified in Schedule 1 are amended in the manner ~ts 
specified in that Schedule. Acts in relation 

to penalty 
units and 
other penalties. 

6-The Acts Interpretation Act 1931* and the Acts Interpreta- ~=~al 
tion Amendment Act 1981 t a~e amended in the manner specified of Acts . 
• I"terpr~tatlo" 
in Schedule 2. Act 1931 

7-( 1) Schedule 3 has effect. 

( 2) Schedule 4 has effect. 

and Acts 
I"terP'~tatlo" 
Ammdmmt 
Act 1981. 

Amendments 
consequential 
on commence· 
ment of 
Polic~ 
O/l~tIC~$ 
Amendmmt 
Act (No. 2) 
198'. 

8-( 1) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary in this Act or ~x~~tion 
any other Act, the provisions of the Acts specified in Schedule 1, 
as in force immediately before the day on which this Act receives 
the Royal assent, apply to and in relation to offences committed 
or alleged to have been committed under those Acts and acts done, 
or omitted to be done, or alleged to have been done, or to have 
been omitted to be done, under those Acts before that day, and, 
for the purposes of that application, the provisions of the Acts so 
specified, as so in force, shall be deemed to remain in force. 

( 2) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary in this Act or any 
other Act, the provisions of section 46A of the Police Offences Act 
1935, as in force-

( a) on the day on which this Act receives the Royal assent, 
in a case to which section 2 (3) of this Act applies; 
or 

( b) on the day fixed by proclamation under section 2 (2) of 
the Police Offences Amendment Act (No. 2) 1985, in 
any other case, 

apply to or in relation to offences committed or alleged to have 
been committed under section 46A of the Police Offences Act 1935 
before the day referred to in paragraph (a) or (b), as the case 
requires, and, for the purposes of this subsection. the provisions 
of section 46A of the Police Offences Act 1935, as so in force, shall 
be deemed to remain in force. 

* 22 Geo. V No. 59. For this Act, as amended to 1st July 1986, see the continuing Reprint of Statutes. 
Subsequently amended by No. 92 of 1986. 

t No. 39 of 1981. 



116 

Transitional 
provision. 

No. 13 Penalty Units and Other Penalties 1987 

9-During the period of 2 months commencing on the day on 
which this Act receives the Royal assent, a vendor by retail of 
cigars, cigarettes, or tobacco who complies with the provisions of 
section 32 (2) of the Police Offences Act 1935, as in force 
immediately before that day, is not guilty of an offence against that 
Act. 



1987 Penalty Units and Other Penalties No. 13 

SCHEDULE 1 Section 5 

AMENDMENTS OF CERTAIN ACTS IN RELATION TO PENALTY UNITS AND 

OTHER PENALTIES 

Acts Interpretation Act 1931 

(22 Geo V No. 59) 

Section 37 is amended by adding the following subsection after sub
section (5):-

(6) Nothing in the Penalty Units and Other Penalties Act 1987 
affects or prejudices the application of this section in respect of the 
specification of a penalty in an Act, whether or not that penalty was 
so specified before, or that penalty is so specified on or after, the day 
on which the Penalty Units and Other Penalties Act 1987 receives the 
Royal assent. 

Alcohol and Drug Dependency Act 1968 
(No. 61 of 1968) 

1-Section 18 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsection (1) « Penalty: $200."; 

(b) by inserting after that subsection the following subsection:-
( lA) A medical practitioner who fails to comply with sub

section (1) is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary 
conviction to a penalty not exceeding 20 penalty units. 

2-Section 19 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting « Except" and substituting" (1) Except"; 
(b) by omitting" Penalty: $200."; 
(c) by adding the following subsection as subsection (2 ) of that 

section:-
(2) A medical practitioner who contravenes subsection (1) 

is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding 20 penalty units. 

3-Section 20 (7) is amended by omitting" to a penalty of $200" and 
substituting " on summary conviction to a penalty not exceeding 20 penalty 
units" . 

4-Section 62 is amended as follows:-

(a) by omitting from subsections (1) and ( 2 ) "No person shall", 
wherever occurring, and substituting "A person shall not "; 

(b) by omitting from those subsections" Penalty: $200 or 12 months' 
imprisonment.", wherever occurring; 

117 



118 No. 13 Penalty Units and Other Penalties 1987 

(c) by adding the following subsection after subsection (2):-
(3) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 

or (2) is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction 
to a penalty not exceeding 20 penalty units or to imprisonment 
for a term not exceeding 12 months. 

5-Section 63 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting" No person," and substituting "(1) A person,"; 
( b) by inserting " not " after " shall "; 

(c) by omitting" Penalty: $200 or 12 months' imprisonment."; 

(d) by adding the following subsection as subsection (2) of that 
section:-

(2) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 
is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a 
penalty not exceeding 20 penalty units or to imprisonment for 
a term not exceeding 12 months. 

6-Section 64 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting " No person shall-" and substituting "( 1) A person 

shall not-"; 
(b) by omitting "Penalty: $200 or 12 months' imprisonment."; 

(c) by adding the following subsection as subsection (2) of that 
section:-

(2) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 
is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding 20 penalty units or to imprisonment 
for a term not exceeding 12 months. 

7-Section 65 is amended as follows:-

(a) by omitting from subsections (2), (3), and (4) " No person shall", 
wherever occurring, and substituting "A person shall not "; 

(b) by omitting subsection (5) and substituting the following sub
section:-

(5) A person who contravenes a provision of this section is 
guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a 
penalty not exceeding 20 penalty units or to imprisonment for 
a term not exceeding 12 months. 

Motor Vehicles Securities Act 1984 

(No. 43 of 1984) 

1-Section 6 (3) is amended by omitting" $1 000 " and substituting" 10 
penalty units ". 



1987 Penalty Units and Other Penalties 

2-Section 10 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting "A" and substituting "(1) A"; 
(b) by omitting " Penalty: $1 000 "; 

No. 13 

(c) by adding the following subsection as subsection (2) of that 
section:-

(2) A person who contravenes subsection (1) is guilty of an 
offence and is liable on summary conviction to a penalty not 
exceeding 10 penalty units. 

3-Section 12 is amended by omitting" $1 000" and substituting" 10 
penalty units". 

4-Section 17 (3) is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting " $500 " and substituting " 5 penalty units"; 
(b) by omitting " $10" and substituting " O· 1 penalty unit". 

Motor V,ehicles Taxation Act 1981 

(No. 68 of 1981) 
l-Section 7 (2) is amended by omitting" $500" and substituting" 5 

penalty units". 

2-Section 16 (1) is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting " $500 " and substituting " 5 penalty units"; 
(b) by omitting " $50 " and substituting " o· 5 penalty unit". 

3-Section 17 (1) is amended by omitting " $1 000 and" and substituting 
" 1 0 penalty units or". 

4-Section 18 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsection (1) "Penalty: $1000."; 
(b) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-

(lA) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 
is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a 
penalty not exceeding 10 penalty units. 

5-Section 20 (2) is amended by omitting " $500 " and substituting " 5 
penalty units ". 

Police Offences Act 1935 

(26 Geo. V No. 44) 

I-Section 4 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsection (1) "No person in any public place 

shall be found-" and substituting "A person shall not, in a 
public place, be found-"; 

119 



120 No. 13 Penalty Units and Other Penalties 1987 

( b) by omitting paragraphs (a) and (b) of that subsection and sub
stituting the following paragraphs:-

(a) drunk and incapable of taking care of himself; 
( b) drunk and disorderly; or 

(c) by omitting from paragraph (c) of that subsection "Penalty: $40, 
or 3 months' imprisonment."; 

(d) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-
(lA) A person who contravenes subsection (1) (a), (b), or 

( c) is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction 
to--

(a) a penalty not exceeding one penalty unit or to imprison
ment for a term not exceeding one month, in the 
case of an offence under subsection (I) (a) or (b); 
or 

(b) a penalty not exceeding 3 penalty units or to imprison
ment for a term not exceeding 3 months, in the case 
of an offence under subsection (1) (c). 

2-Section 5 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsection (2) "Penalty: 6 months' imprison

ment."; 
(b) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-

(2A) A person who is guilty of an offence under subsection 
( 2) is liable on summary conviction to imprisonment for a term 
not exceeding 6 months. 

3-Section 6 is amended as folIows:-
(a) by omitting from subsections (I) and (2) "No person shall ", 

wherever occurring, and substituting "A person shall not "; 
(b) by omitting from subsection (I) "Penalty: 6 months' imprison

ment."; 
(c) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-

(lA) A person who contravenes subsection (I) is guilty of 
an offence and is liable on summary conviction to imprisonment 
for a term not exceeding 6 months. 

4-Section 7 is amended as follows:-

(a) by omitting from subsection (I) "No person, being a suspected 
person or reputed thief, shall-" and substituting "A persOlll, 
being a suspected person or reputed thief, shall not-"; 

(b) by omitting from that subsection "Penalty: 6 months' imprisOlll
ment."; 

(c) by omitting from subsection (3) "No person shall" and sub
stituting "A person shall not "; 



1987 Penalty Units and Other Penalties No. 13 

(d) by omitting from that subsection" Penalty: 6 months' imprison
ment."; 

( e) by adding the following subsection after subsection (4):-

(5) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 
or (3) is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction 
to imprisonment for a term not exceeding 6 months. 

5-Section 8 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsections (1), (lA), and (lB) "No person 

shall", wherever occurring, and substituting "A person shall 
not "; 

(b) by omitting from subsection (1) "Penalty: $100, or 6 months' 
imprisonment." ; 

(c) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-
(lAA) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 

is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a 
penalty not exceeding 5 penalty units or to imprisonment for a 
term not exceeding 6 months. 

(d) by omitting from subsection (lA) "Penalty: $200, or 12 months' 
imprisonment."; 

(e) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-
(lAB) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection 

( lA) is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction 
to a penalty not exceeding 10 penalty units or to imprisonment 
for a term not exceeding 12 months. 

(f) by omitting from subsection (lB) the passage beginning with 
co Penalty" and ending with" two years imprisonment."; 

(g) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:
(le) A person who contravenes subsection (lB) is guilty of 

an offence and is liable on summary conviction to imprisonment 
for a term not exceeding-

(a) 12 months for a first offence; or 
(b) 2 years for a second or subsequent offence. 

6-Section 9 is amended as follows:-

(a) by omitting" No person in any public place shall-" and sub
stituting "(1) A person shall not, in a public place-"; 

(b) by omitting" Penalty: 6 months' imprisonment."; 

(c) by adding the following subsection as subsection (2) of that 
section:-

( 2) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 
is guilty of an offence and is liable on .summary conviction to 
imprisonment for a term not exceeding 6 months. 

121 



122 No. 13 Penalty Units and Other Penalties 1987 

7-Section 10 of the Principal Act is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsection (1) "No person" and substituting 

"A person "; 
(b) by omitting from that subsection" shall-" and substituting" shall 

not-"; 
(c) by omitting from that subsection" Penalty: $200, or 6 months' 

imprisonment."; 
(d) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-

( lA) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 
is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a 
penalty not exceeding 5 penalty units or to imprisonment for 
a term not exceeding 6 months. 

(e) by inserting in subsection (3) "a period not exceeding" after 
" behaviour for "; 

(I) by omitting from that subsection "$40" and substituting c, 2 
penalty units "; 

(g) by omitting from that subsection " two months" and substituting 
" a term not exceeding 2 months"; 

(h) by omitting from subsection (4) "$40" and substituting "2 
penalty units ". 

8-Section 11 of the Principal Act is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting" No person shall-" and substituting "(1) A person 

shall not-"; 
(b) by omitting" Penalty: $40."; 

(c) by adding the following subsection as subsection ( 2 ) of. that 
section:-

(2) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 
is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding 2 penalty units. 

9-Section 12 of the Principal Act is amended as follows:-

(a) by omitting from subsection (1) "No person" and substituting 
"A person shall not,"; 

(b) by omitting from that subsection" therein, shall-" and substituting 
"in that place-"; 

(c) by omitting from that subsection" Penalty: $40, or 3 months' 
imprisonment." ; 

(d) by inserting the following subsection af.ter that subsection:-
(lA) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 

is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding 3 penalty units or to imprisonment for 
a term not exceeding 3 months. 



1987 Penalty Units and Other Penalties No. 13 

10-Section 13 of the Principal Act is amended as follows:-

(a) by omitting from subsection (1) "No person, in any public place, 
shall-" and substituting "A person shall not, in a pubJic 
place--"; 

(b) by omitting from that subsection "Penalty: $40, or 3 months' 
imprisonment."; 

(c) by omitting from subsection (2) "Penalty: $400, or one month's 
imprisonment."; 

(d) by omitting from subsections (3), (4), (5), (5A), (10), (11), 
(12), and (13) "No person shall", wherever occurring, and 
substituting "A person shall not "; 

(e) by omitting from subsection (3) "Penalty: $40, or 3 months' 
imprisonment."; 

(f) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:

(3AA) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1), 
( 2 ), or (3) is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary 
conviction to-

(a) a penalty not exceeding 3 penalty units or to imprison
ment for a term not exceeding 3 months, in the case 
of an offence under subsection (1) or (3); or 

(b) a penalty not exceeding 5 penalty units or to imprison
ment for a term not exceeding 6 months, in the case 
of an offence under subsection (2). 

(g) by omitting from subsection (4) "Penalty: $120."; 

(h) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-
( 4A) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (4) 

is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a 
penalty not exceeding 3 penalty units. 

(i) by omitting from subsection (5) "Penalty: $12 and a daily penalty 
of $3."; 

(i) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-
(5AA) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (5) 

is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a 
penalty not exceeding o· 5 penalty unit and to a daily penalty 
not exceeding O· 1 penalty unit for each day during which the 
offence continues. 

(k) by omitting from subsection (5A) "Penalty: $80."; 

(l) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:
(5AB) A person who contravenes subsection (5A) is guilty of 

an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a penalty not 
exceeding 2 penalty units. 

(m) by omitting from subsections (6) and (7) "No person", wherever 
occurring, and substituting "A person "; 

123 



124 No, 13 Penalty Units and Other Penalties 1987 

( n) by inserting in subsections (6) and (7) "not" after cc shall "J 
~herever occurring; 

(0) by omitting from subsection (6) "Penalty: $120,"; 
(p) by inserting the follo~ing subsection after that subsection:-

(6A) A person ~ho contravenes subsection (6) is guilty of 
an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a penalty 
not exceeding 3 penalty units. 

(q) by omitting from subsection (7) the passage beginning with 
" Penalty" and ending ~ith " $120."; 

(r) by inserting the follo~ing subsection after that subsection:-
(7 A) A person ~ho contravenes subsection (7) is guilty of 

an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a penalty not 
exceeding O' 3 penalty unit or to a penalty not exceeding 3 
penalty units for any fifth or subsequent offence ~ithin a period 
of 5 years. 

(5) by omitting from subsection (10) "Penalty: $12."; 
(t) by inserting the follo~ing subsection after that subsection:-

( 10A) A person ~ho contravenes a provision of subsection 
(10) is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction 
to a penalty not exceeding 0·5 penalty unit. 

(u) by omitting from subsection (11) "Penalty: $30."; 
(v) by inserting the follo~ing subsection after that subsection:

(llA) A person ~ho contravenes a provision of subsection 
(11) is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction 
to a penalty not exceeding one penalty unit. 

(w) by omitting from subsection (12) "Penalty: $40 or one month's 
imprisonment."; 

(x) by inserting the follo~ing subsection after that subsection:-
( 12A) A person ~ho contravenes a provision of subsection 

( 12) is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction 
to a penalty not exceeding one penalty unit or to imprisonment 
for a term not exceeding one month. 

(y) by omitting from subsection (13) "Penalty: $120 or 3 months' 
imprisonment." ; 

(z) by adding the follo~ing subsection after that subsection:-
(14) .A person ~ho contravenes a provision of subsection (13) 

is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding 3 penalty units or to imprisonment for 
a term not exceeding 3 months. 

11-Section 14 is amended as follo~s:-
(a) by omitting" No person," and substituting" (1) A person shall 

not,"; 
(b) by omitting" shall bathe" and substituting cc bathe "; 



1987 Penalty Units and Other Penalties No. 13 

(c) by omitting" Penalty: $10."; 

(d) by adding the following subsection as subsection (2) of that 
section:-

(2) A person who contravenes subsection (1) is guilty of 
an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a penalty not 
exceeding one penalty unit. 

12-Section 14A is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting" No person shall" and substituting "(1) A person 

shall not"; 
(b) by omitting" Penalty: $100 or 6 months' imprisonment."; 
(c) by adding the following subsection as subsection ( 2 ) of that 

section:-
(2) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 

is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding 5 penalty units or to imprisonment for 
a term not exceeding 6 months. 

13-Section 14B is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsection (1) "No person shall," and sub

stituting "A person shall not,"; 
(b) by omitting from subsection (2) "penalty of-" and substituting 

" penalty not exceeding-"; 
(c) by omitting from subsection (2) (a) "$200 or 12 months' imprison

ment," and substituting" 10 penalty units or to imprisonment 
for a term not exceeding 12 months,"; 

(d) by omitting from subsection (2) (b) " $100 or 6 months' imprison
ment," and substituting "5 penalty units or to imprisonment 
for a term not exceeding 6 months,". 

14-Section 14c (2) is amended by omitting "conviction, is liable to a 
penalty of $50 " and substituting" summary conviction, is liable to a penalty 
not exceeding 2 penalty units". 

15-Section 15 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsections (1), (2), and (6) " No person shall", 

wherever occurring, and substituting "A person shall not"; 
(b) by omitting from subsection (1) "Penalty: $40."; 
(c) by omitting from subsection (2) "Penalty: $40 and a daily penalty 

of $10."; 
(d) by omitting from subsection (6) "Penalty: $40"; 
(e) by adding the following subsection after that subsection:-

( 7) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 
or (2) or who contravenes subsection (6) is guilty of an offence 
and is liable on summary conviction to-

125 



126 No. 13 Penalty Units and Other Penalties 1987 

(a) a penalty not exceeding 2 penalty units; and 
( b) a daily penalty not exceeding o· 5 penalty unit for each 

day during which the offence continues, in the case 
of an offence under subsection (2). 

16-Section 15A is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsection (1) "No person shall" and sub

stituting "A person shall not,"; 
(b) by omitting from that subsection" Penalty: $100."; 
(c) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-

( lA) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 
is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding 5 penalty units. 

17-Section 15B is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsection (1) "liable to a penalty of $160" 

and substituting" guilty of an offence and is liable on summary 
conviction to a penalty not exceeding 5 penalty units "; 

(b) by omitting from subsection (2) "liable to a penalty of $100" 
and substituting" guilty of an offence and is liable on summary 
conviction to a penalty not exceeding 3 penalty units". 

18-Section 15c is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsections (1), (3), and (4) " No person shall", 

wherever occurring, and substituting "A person shall not "; 
(b) by omitting from subsections (1) and (2) "Penalty: $160.", 

wherever occurring; 
(c) by omitting from subsection (2) "No person being the owner or 

occupier of any land adjoining a highway shall-" and sub
stituting "A person, being the owner or occupier of any land 
adjoining a highway, shall not-"; 

-- (d) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-
(2A) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 

or (2) is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction 
to a penalty not exceeding 5 penalty units. 

(e) by omitting from subsections (3) and (4) "Penalty: $40.", 
wherever occurring; 

(/) by adding the following subsection after subsection (4):-
( 5) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (3) 

or who contravenes subsection ( 4) is guilty of an offence and 
is liable on summary conviction to a penalty not exceeding 2 
penalty units. 

19-5ection 15n is amended bv omitting "liable to a penalty of $500 " 
and substitvting " guiltv of an offence and is liable on summary conviction 
to a penalty not exceeding 20 penalty units ". 



1987 Penalty Units and Other Penalties No. 13 

20-Section 15E is amended as follo\\'s:-
(a) by omitting from subsections (1) and (2) "No person shall", 

wherever occurring, and substituting "A person shall not "; 
(b) by omitting subsection (4) and substituting the following sub

section:-
( 4) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 

or (2) is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction 
to a penalty not exceeding-

(a) 5 penalty units, in the case of an offence under sub
section (2) (a); or 

(b) 2 penalty units, in the case of any other offence. 

21-Section 16 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting "No person" and substituting "( 1) A person"; 

(b) by omitting " shall-" and substituting " shall not-"; 
(c) by omitting « Penalty: $20."; 
(d) by adding the following subsection as subsection (2) of that 

section:-
(2) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 

is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding one penalty unit. 

22-Section 17 is amended as fo11ows:-
(a) by omitting from subsection (1) "No person," and substituting 

"A person,"; 
(b) by inserting in that subsection « not" before « fail "; 

(c) by omitting from that subsection « Penalty: $10."; 
(d) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-

(lA) A person who contravenes subsection (1) is guilty of 
an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a penalty not 
exceeding one penalty unit. 

23-Section 17 A is amended by omitting « liable to a penalty of $30" 
and substituting " guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction 
to a penalty not exceeding one penalty unit". 

24-Section 17B is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting "No person shall" and substituting « ( 1) A person 

shall not "; 
(b) by omitting « Penalty: $80."; 
(c) by adding the following subsection as subsection (2) of that 

section:-
(2) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 

is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding 3 penalty units. 

127 



128 No. 13 Penalty Units and Other Penalties 1987 

25-Section 18 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsections (1) and (lA) "No person shall", 

wherever occurring, and substituting "A person shall not"; 
(b) by omitting from subsection (1) "Penalty: $40."; 
(c) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-

(lA) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 
is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding 2 penalty units. 

(d) by omitting from subsection (lA) "Penalty: $100 or 6 months' 
imprisonment."; 

(e) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-
(lB) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (lA) 

is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding 5 penalty units or to imprisonment for 
a term not exceeding 6 months. 

26-Section 19 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsections (1) and (2) "No person shall", 

wherever occurring, and substituting "A person shall not "; 
(b) by omitting from subsection (3) "No occupier of any land shall " 

and substituting "An occupier of any land shall not "; 
(c) by omitting from that subsection" Penalty: $100, or 6 months' 

imprisonment." ; 
(d) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-

(3A) A person who contravenes subsection (1), (2), or (3) 
is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding 5 penalty units or to imprisonment for 
a term not exceeding 6 months. . 

27-Section 19AA is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting "No person shall" and substituting "( 1) A person 

shall not "; 
(b) by omitting "Penalty: $200 or 6 months' imprisonment."; 
(c) by adding the following subsection as subsection (2) of that 

section:-
(2) A person who contravenes subsection (1) is guilty of 

an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a penalty not 
exceeding 5 penalty units or to imprisonment for a term not 
exceeding 6 months. 

28-Section 19A is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsection (1) "No person shalI-" and sub

stituting (CA person shall not-"; 
(b) by omitting from that subsection "Penalty: $40, or 3 months' 

imprisonment." ; 



1987 Penalty Units and Other Penalties No. 13 

(c) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-
(lAA) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 

is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a 
penalty not exceeding 3 penalty units or to imprisonment for 
a term not exceeding 3 months. 

29-Section 20 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsection (1) "No person" and substituting 

"A person "; 
(b) by omitting from that subsection" shall-" and substituting" shall 

not-"; 
(c) by omitting from that subsection "Penalty: $40, or 3 months' 

imprisonment."; 
(d) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-

( lA) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 
is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a 
penalty not exceeding 3 penalty units or to imprisonment for 
a term not exceeding 3 months. 

30-Section 20AA is amended by omitting" liable to a penalty of $120 " 
and substituting " guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction 
to a penalty not exceeding 3 penalty units". 

31-Section 22 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsection (1) "No person being a child shall " 

and substituting "A child shall not"; 
(b) by omitting from that subsection" Penalty: $10."; 
(c) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-

(lA) A child who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 
is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding one penalty unit. 

(d) by omitting from subsection (2) " No person shall" and substituting 
"A person shall not "; 

(e) by omitting from that subsection" Penalty: $40."; 
(f) by adding the following subsection after that subsection:-

(3) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (2) 
is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding 2 penalty units. 

32-Section 24 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsections ( 1) and (2) "No person shall", 

wherever occurring, and substituting "A person shall not "; 
(b) by omitting from subsection (1) "Penalty: $100;"; 

129 



130 No. 13 Penalty Units and Other Penalties 1987 

(c) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-
(lA) A person who contravenes subsection (1) is guilty of 

an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a penalty not 
exceeding 5 penalty units. 

(d) by omitting from subsection (2) "Penalty: $200, or 12 months' 
imprisonment." ; 

(e) by adding the following subsection after that subsection:-
(3) A person who contravenes subsection (2) is guilty of an 

offence and is liable on summary conviction to a penalty not 
exceeding 10 penalty units or to imprisonment for a term not 
exceeding 12 months. 

33-Section 24A is amended as fol!ows:-
(a) by omitting from subsection (1) "No person shall," and sub

stituting "A person shall not,"; 
(b) by omitting from that subsection" Penalty: $40."; 
(c) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-

( lA) A person who contravenes subsection (1) is guilty of 
an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a penalty not 
exceeding 2 penalty units. 

34-Section 31 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsections (1) and (2) "No child shall", 

wherever occurring, and substituting "A child shall not"; 
(b) by omitting from subsection (1) the passage beginning with 

" Penalty:" and ending with " $1."; 
(c) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-

(lA) A child who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 
is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a 
penalty not exceeding-

(a) 0·05 penalty unit, for a first offence; or 
(b) 0·1 penalty unit, for a second or subsequent offence. 

35-Section 32 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsections (1) and (2), wherever occurring, " No 

person shall sell" and substituting "A person shall not sell "; 
(b) by omitting from subsection (1) "Penalty: $40."; 
(c) by inserting the following subsection after subsection (1):-

(lA) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 
is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a 
penalty not exceeding 2 penalty units. 

(d) by omitting from subsection (2) "$10.", where firstly occurring, 
and substituting" Not exceeding $200."; 

(e) by omitting from that subsection" No person under the age of 16 
years shall" and substituting "A person under the age of 16 
years shall not "; 



1987 Penalty Units and Other Penalties No. 13 

(f) by omitting from that subsection "50 cents" and substituting 
" Not exceeding $5 "; 

(g) by omitting from that subsection" Penalty: $10.", where secondly 
occurring; 

(h) by omitting from subsection (3) "Penalty: $40."; 
(i) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:

(3A) A person who fail3 to comply with subsection (2) or 
(3) is guilty of an offence ad is liable on summary conviction 
to a penalty not exceeding-

( a) one penalty unit, in the case of an offence under sub
section (2); or 

(b) 2 penalty units, in the case of an offence under sub
section (3). 

36-Section 33 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsection (1) "No person shall-" and sub

stituting "A person shall not-"; 
(b) by omitting from that subsection the passage after paragraph (d); 

(c) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-
( lA) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 

is guilty of an offer.ce and is liable on summary conviction to--
(a) a penalty of not less than one penalty unit and not 

more than 20 penalty units; 
(b) imprisonment for a term of not less than one month 

and not more than 2 years; or 
(c) both such a penalty and such imprisonment. 

37-Section 34B is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsections (1) and (2) "No person shall-", 

wherever occurring, and substituting "A person shall not-"; 
(b) by omitting from subsection (1) "Penalty: $200 or 12 months' 

imprisonment." ; 
(c) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-

(lA) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 
is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding 10 penalty units or to imprisonment for 
a term not exceeding 12 months. 

(d) by omitting from subsection (2) "Penalty: $100 or 6 months' 
imprisonment."; 

(e) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-

(2A) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (2) 
is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding 5 penalty units or to imprisonment for 
a term not exceeding 6 months. 

131 



132 No. 13 Penalty Units and Other Penalties 1987 

38-Section 35 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting subsection (1) and substituting the following sub. 

sections:-
( 1) A person shall not unlawfully assault another person. 
( lA) A person who contravenes subsection (1) is guilty of 

an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a penalty not 
exceeding 5 penalty units or to imprisonment for a term not 
exceeding 6 months. 

(b) by omitting from subsection (2) "of $200 or to 12 months' 
imprisonment" and substituting" not exceeding 10 penalty units 
or to imprisonment for a term not exceeding 12 months "; 

(c) by omitting from that subsection " 6 " and substituting " 12 "; 
(d) by omitting from subsection (3) "of $200 or to 12 months' 

imprisonment" and substituting " not exceeding 20 penalty units 
or to imprisonment for a term not exceeding 2 years"; 

(e) by omitting from that subsection" 6 months" and substituting" 2 
years ". 

39-Section 35A is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting "Any" and substituting "( 1) Any"; 
(b) by omitting" Penalty: $100 or 6 months' imprisonment or both."; 
(c) by adding the following subsection as subsection (2) of that 

section:-
(2) A person who contravenes subsection (1) is guilty of 

an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a penalty not 
exceeding 5 penalty units or to imprisonment for a term not 
exceeding 6 months or both. 

40-Section 36 is amended as follows:-

(a) by omitting from subsection (1) "No person in charge of any 
animal or vehicle shall," and substituting "A person in charge 
of any animal or vehicle shall not,"; 

(b) by omitting from that subsection" Penalty: Two years' imprison
ment."; 

(c) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-
( lA) A person who contravenes subsection (1) is guilty of 

an offence and is liable on summary conviction to imprisonment 
for a term not exceeding 2 years. 

41-Section 37 is amended as follows:-

(a) by omitting "No person shall", wherever occurring, and sub
stituting "A person shall not "; 

(b) by omitting from subsections (1) and (2) "Penalty: $200, or 12 
months' imprisonment.", wherever occurring; 



1987 Penalty Units and Other Penalties No. 13 

(c) by inserting the following subsection after subsection (2):-
(2A) A person who contravenes subsection (1) or (2) is 

guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a 
penalty not exceeding 10 penalty units or to imprisonment for 
a term not exceeding 12 months. 

(d) by omitting from subsection (3) "Penalty: $40."; 
(e) by inserting the following sL'bsection after that subsection:-

(3A) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (3) 
is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding 2 penalty units. 

(f) by omitting from subsection (4) "Penalty: $6."; 
(g) by adding the following subsection after subsection (4):-

(5) A person who contravenes subsection (4) is guilty of an 
offence and is liable on summary conviction to a penalty not 
exceeding one penalty unit. 

42-Section 37c is amended by omitting "No person shall" and sub
stituting "A person shall not ". 

43-Section 37E is amended by omitting" of $1 000 or 3 years' imprison
ment " and substituting " not exceeding 50 penalty units or to imprisonment 
for a term not exceeding 3 years ". 

44-Section 38 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting "No person shall" and substituting "( 1) A person 

shall not "; 
(b) by omitting" Penalty: 12 months' imprisonment."; 
(c) by adding the following subsection as subsection (2) of that 

section:-
(2) A person who contravenes subsection (1) is guilty of 

an offence and is liable on summary conviction to imprisonment 
for a term not exceeding 12 months. . 

45-Section 39 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting "No person shall" and substituting "( 1) A person 

shall not"; 

(b) by omitting the paragraph after "charged therewith."; 

(c) by adding the following subsection as subsection (2) of that 
section:-

(2) A person who contravenes subsection (1) is guilty of 
an offence and is liable on summary conviction to imprisonment 
for a term not exceeding-

(a) 12 months for a first offence; or 
(b) 2 years for a second or subsequent offence. 

133 



134 No. 13 Penalty Units and OllJer Penalties 1987 

46-Section 39A is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting " No person shall-" and substituting "( 1) A person 

shall not-"; 
(b) by omitting" Penalty: $400 or 6 months' imprisonment."; 
(c) by adding the following subsection as subsection (2) of that 

section:-
(2) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 

is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding 10 penalty units or to imprisonment 
for a term not exceeding 12 months. 

47-Section 40 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsection (1) "No person shall-" and sub

stituting "A person shall not-"; 
(b) by omitting from that subsection "Penalty: 6 months' imprison

ment."; 
(c) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-

( lA) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 
is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
imprisonment for a term not exceeding 6 months. 

48-Section 41 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting " No person shall-" and substituting "( 1) A person 

shall not-"; 
(b) by omitting" Penalty: $100."; 
(c) by adding the following subsection as subsection (2) of that 

section:-
(2) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 

is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding 5 penalty units. 

49-Section 42 is amended as follows:-

(a) by omitting from subsections (1) and (2) "No person shall", 
wherever occurring, and substituting "A person shall not"; 

(b) by omitting from subsection (1) the passage after paragraph (b); 

(c) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-
( lA) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 

is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to--
(a) a penalty not exceeding 5 penalty units or imprison

ment for a term not exceeding 6 months, for a first 
offence; or 

(b) a penalty not exceeding 20 penalty units or imprisoOr 
ment for a term not exceeding 2 years, for a second 
or subsequent offence. 



1987 Penalty Units and Other Penalties No. 13 

(d) by omitting subsection (3) and substituting the following sub
section:-

(3) Subject to subsections (4) and (5), a person who con
travenes a provision of subsection (2) is guilty of an offence and 
is liable on summary conviction to-

(a) a penalty not exceeding 10 penalty units or imprison
ment for a term not exceeding 12 months, for a first 
offence; or 

(b) imprisonment for a term of not less than 12 months 
or more than 2 years, for a second or subsequent 
offence. 

(e) by omlttmg from subsection ( 4) "$100" and substituting "3 
penalty units ". 

50-Section 43 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsections (1) and (2) "No person shall", 

wherever occurring, and substituting "A person shall not "; 
(b) by omitting from subsection (1) "Penalty: $20."; 
(c) by inserting the following subsection after subsection (1):-

(lA) A person who contravenes subsection (1) is guilty of 
an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a penalty not 
exceeding one penalty unit. 

(d) by omitting from subsection (2) "Penalty: $40."; 
(e) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-

(2A) A person who contravenes subsection (2) is guilty of 
an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a penalty not 
exceeding 2 penalty units. 

(f) by omitting from subsection (3) "$200" and substituting 
" $1 000 ". 

51-Section 44 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsection (1) "No person shall" and sub

stituting "A person shall not "; 
(b) by omitting from that subsection "Penalty: $100 or 3 months' 

imprisonment." ; 
(c) by omitting from subsection (2) "No" and substituting "A"; 
(d) by omitting from that subsection " shall" and substituting " shall 

not "; 
( e) by inserting the following subsection after subsection (2):-

(2A) A person who contravenes subsection (1) or (2) is 
guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a 
penalty not exceeding 5 penalty units or to imprisonment for a 
term not exceeding 6 months. 

135 



136 No. 13 Penalty Units and Other Penalties 1987 

52-Section 44A is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsection (1) "No person shall," and sub

stituting "A person shall not,"; 
(b) by omitting from that subsection" Penalty: $100, or 3 months' 

imprisonment."; 
(c) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-

( lA) A person who contravenes subsection (1) is guilty of 
an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a penalty not 
exceeding 5 penalty units or to imprisonment for a term not 
exceeding 6 months. 

53-Section 46 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsection (1) " No person other than the owner 

thereof shall-" and substituting "A person other than its owner 
shall not-"; 

(b) by omitting from that subsection" Penalty: $10."; 
(c) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-

( lA) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 
is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding one penalty unit. 

54-Section 48 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting" No person shall" and substituting "(1) A person 

shall not "; 
(b) by omitting" Penalty: $100."; 
(c) by adding the following subsection as subsection (2) of that 

section:-
(2) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 

is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding 5 penalty units. 

55-Section 49 (3A) is amended by omitting "$5" and substituting 
" $10 ". 

56-Section 49B (2) is amended by omitting "is liable to a penalty of 
$500" and substituting" is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary 
conviction to a penalty not exceeding 10 penalty units". 

57-Section 49c is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting "No person shall" and substituting "(1) A person 

shall not "; 
(b) by omitting" Penalty: $500."; 
(c) by adding the following subsection as subsection (2) of that 

section:-
(2) A person who contravenes subsection (1) is guilty of 

an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a penalty not 
exceeding 10 penalty units. 



1987 Penalty Units and Other Penalties No. 13 

58-Section 51 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting" No person shall" and substituting" (1) A person 

shall not "; 
(b) by omitting" Penalty: $40."; 
(c) by adding the following subsection as subsection (2) of that 

section:-
( 2) A person who contravenes subsection (1) is guilty of 

an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a penalty not 
exceeding 2 penalty units. 

59-Section 52 (1) is amended by omitting "two dollars" and sub
stituting " $10 ". 

60-Section 53 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsection (2) "No person holding any such 

licence as aforesaid shall" and substituting "A person who holds 
a tanner's licence shall not "; 

(b) by omitting from that subsection" Penalty: $100."; 
(c) by adding the following subsection after subsection (2):-

( 3) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (2) 
is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding 3 penalty units. 

61-Section 54 is amended as follows:-
(a) by omitting from subsection (2) "No person shall" and sub

stituting "A person shall not "; 
(b) by omitting from that subsection" Penalty: $40."; 
(c) by adding the following subsection after subsection (2):-

( 3) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (2) 
is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding 2 penalty units. 

62-Section 55A (1) is amended as follows:-

(a) by inserting "and is liable on summary conVIction to a penalty 
not exceeding 2 penalty units " after " offence", where secondly 
occurring; 

(b) by omitting" Penalty: $50.". 

63-Section 57 is amended as follows:-

(a) by omitting from subsection (3) "Penalty: $20."; 

(b) by adding the following subsection after that subsection:--
(4) A person who fails to comply with subsection (3) is 

guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to a 
penalty not exceeding one penalty unit. 

137 



138 No. 13 Penalty Units and Other Penalties 

Road Safety (Alcohol and Drugs) Act 1970 

(No. 77 of 1970) 

Section 17 is amended as follows:-

1987 

(a) by omitting from subsection (1) "to a penalty of $500 or 6 
months' imprisonment," and substituting" on summary convic
tion to a penalty not exceeding 10 penalty units or to imprison
ment for a term not exceeding 6 months,"; 

(b) by omitting from subsection (2) "of $ 1000 or 12 months' 
imprisonment" and substituting" not exceeding 20 penalty units 
or to imprisonment for a term not exceeding 12 months,". 



1987 Penalty Units and Other Penalties No. 13 

SCHEDULE 2 Section 6 

CONSEQUENTIAL AMENDMENTS OF ACTS INTERPRETATION ACT 1931 AND 

ACTS INTERPRETATION AMENDMENT ACT 1981 

Acts Interpretation Act 1931 

(22 Geo. V No. 59) 
Section 46 is amended by omitting the definition of " penalty". 

Acts Interpretation Amendment Act 1981 

(No. 39 of 1981) 
Section 20 (2) is amended as follows:-

(a) by omitting "expressions 'offence' and 'penalty'" and sub
stituting "expression' offence' "; 

(b) by omitting "those expressions occur" and substituting "that 
expression occurs ". 

139 



140 No. 13 Penalty Units and Other Penalties 1987 

SCHEDULE 3 Section 7 (1) 

AMENDMENTS CONSEQUENTIAL ON COMMENCEMENT OF POLICE OFFENCES 

AMENDMENT ACT (No. 2) 1985 

Section 46A of the Police Offences Act 1935 is amended as follows:
(a) by omitting" No person shall," and substituting "(1) A person 

shall not,"; 
(b) by omitting" Penalty: $100."; 
(c) by adding the following subsection as subsection (2) of that 

section:-
(2) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 

is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding 3 penalty units. 



1987 Penalty Units and Other Penalties No. 13 

SCHEDULE 4 Section 7 (2) 

AMENDMENTS CONSEQUENTIAL ON COMMENCEMENT OF POLICE OFFENCES 

AMENDMENT ACT (No. 2) 1985 

Section 46A of the Police Offences Act 1935 is amended as follows:
(a) by omitting from subsection (1) "Penalty: $100."; 
(b) by inserting the following subsection after that subsection:-

( lA) A person who contravenes a provision of subsection (1) 
is guilty of an offence and is liable on summary conviction to 
a penalty not exceeding 3 penalty units. 

141 




