
1983 Public Works Committee Amendment No. 7 

PUBLIC WORKS COMMITTEE AMENDMENT ACT 1983 

No. 7 of 1983 

TABLE OF PROVISIONS 

1. Short tide. 
2. Principal Act . 
.3. Amendment of section 15 of Principal Act (Functions 

of Committee). 
4. Amendment of section 16 of Principal Act (Conditions 

precedent to commencing public works). 
5. Amendment of section 17 of Principal Act (Power of 

House of Assembly to extend Act). 

AN ACT to amend the Public Works Committee Act 1914 for the 
purposes of making further provision with respect to the functions 
of The Parliamentary Standing Committee on Public Works. 

[Royal Assent 23 May 1983] 

BE it enacted by His Excellency the Governor of Tasmania, by and 
with the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and 

House of Assembly, in Parliament assembled, as follows:-

1-This Act may be cited as the Public Works Committee Short title. 

Amendment Act 1983. 

25 



26 

Principal Act. 

Amendment of 
section 15 of 
Principal Act 
(Functions of 
Committee) . 

Amendment of 
section 16 of 
Principal Act 
( Conditions 
precedent to 
commencing 
public works). 

Amendment of 
section 17 of 
Principal Act 
(Power of 
House of 
Assembly to 
extend Act). 

No. 7 Public Works Committee Amendment 1983 

2-In this Act, the Public Works Committee Act 1914* is 
referred to as the Principal Act. 

3-Section 15 (1) of the Principal Act is amended by omitting 
" $700 000 " and substituting" $1 000000 ". 

4-Section 16 (1) of the Principal Act is amended by omitting 
" $700000 " and substituting" $1 000 000 ". 

5-Section 17 of the Principal Act is amended by omitting 
" $700000 " and substituting" $1 000000 ". 

* 5 Geo. V No. 32. For this Act as amended up to and including 31st December .1959. see the Reprint 
of Statutes (1826-1959). Vol. 4. p. 1067. Subsequently amended by Nos. 7 and 58 of 1962, No. 66 
of 1964. No. 61 of 1967. No. 65 of 1970. No. 27 of 1973. No. 26 of 1974, No. 89 of 1975. and No . 
.5 of 1980. • 


